
Q1: Name Tijani BEN JEMAA

Q2: Affiliation At-Large

Q3: Responding on behalf of Mediterranean Federation of Internet Association 
(FMAI)

Q4: Is establishing an Empowered Community for
enforcing Community Powers a solution that is
acceptable to you?(Please see Annex 1 -
Recommendation #1: Establishing An Empowered
Community For Enforcing Community Powers for more
information)

Yes, I support this recommendation.

Q5: Is empowering the community through consensus:
engage, escalate, enforce a solution that is acceptable to
you?(Please see Annex 02 - Recommendation #2:
Empowering The Community Through Consensus:
Engage, Escalate, Enforce for more information)

Yes, I support this recommendation.

Q6: Is redefining ICANN’s Bylaws as ‘Standard Bylaws’
and ‘Fundamental Bylaws’ a solution that is acceptable
to you?(Please see Annex 03 - Recommendation #3:
Redefining ICANN’s Bylaws As ‘Standard Bylaws’ And
‘Fundamental Bylaws’ for more information)

Yes, I support this recommendation.
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Q7: Is ensuring community involvement in ICANN
decision-making: seven new Community Powers a
solution that is acceptable to you? (Please refer to
Annex 04: Details on Recommendation 4: Ensuring
Community Involvement In ICANN Decision-Making:
Seven New Community Powers for more information)

Yes, I support this recommendation.

Q8: Is changing aspects of ICANN's Mission,
Commitments and Core Values a solution that is
acceptable to you?(Please refer to Annex 05 - Details on
Recommendation #5: Changing Aspects Of ICANN's
Mission, Commitments And Core Values for more
information)

Yes, I support this recommendation.

Q9: Is reaffirming ICANN's commitment to respect
internationally recognized human rights as it carries out
its Mission a solution that is acceptable to you?(Please
refer to Annex 06 - Recommendation #6: Reaffirming
ICANN's Commitment to Respect Internationally
Recognized Human Rights as it Carries Out Its Mission
for more information)

No, I do not support this recommendation.,

Comment
1, We included in the core values the provision that
"ICANN must carry out its activities in accordance with
applicable law and international law and conventions",
Is there a need to repeat here the ICANN commitment
to respect internationally recognized Human Rights?
Aren't they included in the applicable international law
and conventions mentioned in the core values? 2, You
said that a legal advice told you that upon termination
of the Contract, there would be no significant impact
on ICANN’s Human Rights obligations, So why you
insisted on inclusion of additional language??? 3,
Despite the fact that you were advised that no
significant impact on ICANN's HR obligations would
be brought by the transition, and that the core values
included the obligation of ICANN to comply with the
international law and conventions that already include
HR, you propose to add an interim bylaw provision
because the issue of HR will be extensively addressed
in the Work stream 2, I find this absurde,

Q10: Is strengthening ICANN's Independent Review
Process a solution that is acceptable to you?(Please
refer to Annex 07: Recommendation 7: Strengthening
ICANN's Independent Review Process for more
information)

Yes, I support this recommendation.
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Q11: Is fortifying ICANN's request for reconsideration
process a solution that is acceptable to you?(Please
refer to Annex 08 - Recommendation #8: Improving
ICANN's Request For Reconsideration Process for more
information)

Yes, I support this recommendation.

Q12: Is incorporation of the Affirmation of Commitments
a solution that is acceptable to you?(Please refer to
Annex 09 - Recommendation #9: Incorporation of the
Affirmation of Commitments for more information)

Yes, I support this recommendation.

Q13: Is enhancing the accountability of Supporting
Organizations and Advisory Committees a solution that
is acceptable to you?(Please refer to Annex 10 -
Recommendation #10: Enhancing the Accountability of
Supporting Organizations and Advisory Committees for
more information)

Yes, I support this recommendation.

Q14: Is Board obligations regarding GAC Advice (Stress
Test 18) a solution that is acceptable to you?(Please
refer to Annex 11 - Recommendation #11: Board
obligations regarding GAC Advice)

Respondent skipped this
question

Q15: Is committing to further accountability work in
Work Stream 2 a solution that is acceptable to you?
(Please refer to Annex 12 - Recommendation #12:
Committing to further accountability work in Work
Stream 2)

Yes, I support this recommendation.

Q16: Please submit comments you have in addition to
the information provided above, including on NTIA
criteria, CWG-Stewardship requirements and Stress
Tests.

Respondent skipped this
question
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